CITY OF KINGSVILLE BID TAB    

	Bid No:  2009-24

Opening Date: February 17, 2009

For:       Garbage Roll-Out

              Carts

Dept:   Sanitation 
	Schaefer Systems

Charlotte, N.C.
	Cascade Engineering Co.

Grand Rapids, Mi.
	IPL Waste Handling

St. Damien, QC, Canada
	Ameri-Kart

Wichita, Ks.
	Otto Environmental Systems, LLC

Charlotte, N.C.

	Item     Quantity     Description


	
	
	
	
	

	1. 8,000 Roll-out carts

2. City Logo

3. Assembly & dist.

4. Record serial no.

5. RFID embedded tag

6. Web-based tracking

            After 6 mo. Buy 1

            handheld system

7. Truck retrofit       


	$362,400.00

No Charge

$  28,000.00

$    1,600.00

$   26,800.00

$   10,000.00

$     6,500.00

$   36,000.00

Plus travel expenses ?
	$340,000.00

No Charge

$  26,000.00

$    4,000.00

$  12,000.00

$    4,620.00

$  27,820.00
	$409,120.00

Included

$  28,000.00

$    4,000.00

$  14,000.00

No Bid
No Bid

	$350,640.00
Included

$  22,800.00

$    2,800.00

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
	$335,200.00

No Charge

$  24,000.00

$    4,000.00

$  12,000.00

$  13,200.00
$  48,600.00

	Grand Total
	$471,300.00
	$414,440.00
	$455,120.00*
	$376,240.00*
	$437,000.00

	Delivery:
	60-90 days
	30-45 days
	30-45 days
	60-75 days
	60 days


* Incomplete Bid 




Account No. 064-5-170.2-220.00 & 063-5-170.2-220.00 PPFCO 2007 

Replacement: XXXX 

                       (4,618 carts)                                     (2,166 carts)  

Capital Items: xxxx


                      038-5-170.2-220.00 (1,216 carts) 

	Bid No:  2009-24

Pg. 2
Opening Date: February 17, 2009

For:       Garbage Roll-Out

              Carts

Dept:   Sanitation 
	Toter, Inc.

Statesville, N.C.


	Rotonics Mfg. Co.

Gardena, Ca.
	Rotonics Mfg. Co.

Brownwood, Tx. 



	Rehrig Pacific Co.

Dallas, Tx. 


	Item     Quantity     Description


	
	
	
	

	1. 8,000 Roll-out carts

2. City Logo

3. Assembly & dist.

4. Record serial no.

5. RFID embedded tag

6. Web-based tracking

7. Truck retrofit       


	$317,840.00

Included

$  28,000.00

$    2,000.00

$    5,200.00

No charge for 6 months 

$61,000.00
	$382,400.00

$  17,600.00

$  36,800.00

$    2,800.00

$  42,400.00

$ 134,940.00
$     7,529.00

Software maint. For 1 yr.

 $    7,078.50

For handheld

$36,788.00
	$384,000.00

Included

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
	$359,120.00

No Charge

$  30,400.00

$    6,000.00

$  10,000.00

$    9,040.00

$  42,000.00

	Grand Total
	$414,040.00
	$661,257.00
	$384,000.00*
	$456,560.00

	Delivery:
	30-45 days
	Not Stated
	90 days
	45-60 days


Addition: 




Account No. 064-5-170.2-220.00 & 063-5-170.2-220.00 PPFCO 2007 

Replacement: XXXX 


                       (4,618 carts)                       (2,166 carts  

Capital Items: xxxx


                      038-5-170.2-220.00 (1,216 carts)
