CITY OF KINGSVILLE BID TAB    

*

	Bid No:  2009-21

Opening Date: February 10, 2009

For:        (4) Residential Garbage Trucks

Dept:   Sanitation 
	Rush Truck Center

Laredo, Tx.
	Rush Truck Center

Laredo, Tx.
	Corpus Christi Freightliner
Corpus Christi, Tx.
	Bridgeport Truck Sales
Oklahoma City. Ok.

	Item     Quantity     Description


	Cabover Year 2009
	Conventional

Year 2009
	Year 2010
	Body Only

	1          4      Residential Garbage

                    Trucks

2          4     Chassis ONLY                

         Truck  Make & Model   

         Body Make &  Model           

         Transmission Warranty
         Truck Warranty
Optional Equipment:

Rear Vision Camera System 

LED Body Lights

Smart Lights on tailgate

Auto Lube System for Lift/Tailgate


	219,679.00 ea.

$878,716.00

109,731.00 ea.

$438,924.00

Peterbilt 340/320
Heil Champion Durapack or Pak-Mor HLR-33
Allison 2 yrs. Unl.

1 yr., 100K miles

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
	208,948.00 ea.
$835,792.00

90,000.00 ea.

$360,000.00
	193,361.00
$773,444.00

No Bid

2010 Freightliner M2 106

Heil 28 yd. Python

3 yr., unl. Miles

2 ys. Unl. Miles

Included

Included

Included

Included


	82,550.00
$330,200.00

N/A

Bridgeport Mfg., Ranger 28

N/A

$1,500.00

Included

$500.00

$3,000.00

	          Body Warranty
	1 yr. Heil/6 mo. Pak-Mor
	
	12 months
	1 yr.

	Delivery:
	120 days; 30 days for chassis only
	
	150 days
	90 days


Addition: 




Account No. 064-5-170.2-711.00 

Replacement: XXXX 


Additional Comments:  

Capital Items: xxx



Maintenance Item: 

CITY OF KINGSVILLE BID TAB    

*

	Bid No:  2009-21

Opening Date: February 10, 2009

For:        (2) Commercial Garbage Trucks

Dept:   Sanitation 
	Rush Truck Center

Laredo, Tx.
	Rush Truck Center

Laredo, Tx.
	Corpus Christi Freightliner

Corpus Christi, Tx.
	Bridgeport Truck Sales

Oklahoma City. Ok.

	Item     Quantity     Description


	Cabover Year 2009
	Year 2009
	Year 2010
	

	1          2      Commercial Garbage

                    Trucks

2          2     Chassis ONLY   
         Truck  Make & Model   

         Body Make &  Model    

         Transmission Warranty

         Truck Warranty

         Body Warranty

Optional Equipment:

Rear Vision Camera System 

LED Body Lights

Smart Lights on tailgate

Auto Lube System for Lift/Tailgate


	176,860.00

$353,720.00

Cabover

110,892.00

$443,568.00

Peterbilt 340/320

Heil Champion Durapack or Pak-Mor HLR-33

Allison 2 yrs. Unl.

1 yr., 100K miles

1 yr. Heil/6 mo. Pak-Mor

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
	197,510.00

$395,020.00

Conventional

90,000.00

$360,000.00
	180,157.00      187,047.00
$360,314.00   $374,094.00

No Bid

2010 Freightliner M2 106

Heil 28 yd. Python

3 yr., unl. Miles

2 ys. Unl. Miles

Included

Included

Included

Included


	No Bid

	Delivery:
	120 days; 30 days for chassis only
	
	150 days
	


Addition: 




Account No. 064-5-170.2-711.00 

Replacement: XXXX 


Additional Comments:  

Capital Items: xxx



Maintenance Item: 

