CITY OF KINGSVILLE
BID TABULATION

	Bid No: 10-02

Opening Date: July 21, 2009

For: Tires

Dept: All except Police and Task Force

	American Tire Distributors

Ft. Worth, TX
	A to Z Tire

Corpus Christi, TX
	Southern

Tire Mart

Dallas, TX
	Pueblo Tires

Kingsville, TX

	Item     Quantity     Description


	
	
	
	

	1.  Tires
	$94,257.72*
	$78,615.45
	$86,834.20
	$64,306.67**

	2.  Tire Mounting-Sedans
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$8.00
	$12.50

	3.  Tire Mounting-Ambulance
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$12.00
	$15.00

	4.  Tire Mounting-Pick-ups
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$12.00
	$15.00

	5.  Tire Mounting-Med. Truck
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$20.00
	$35.00

	6.  Tire Mounting-Garb. Truck, Sewer Truck, and Fire Truck
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$20.00
	$35.00

	7.  Tire Mounting-Heavy Equip (scrapers, bulldozers, etc.)
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$40.00
	$85.00

	DELIVERY
	1-2 days
	7 days
	1-3 days
	Not Stated


             * 6 lines left out       **69 out of 134 lines left out
	Cost for Picking up old car tires
	No Bid***
	$1.50 ea.
	$1.00 ea.
	$3.50 ea.

	                                Pick-up tires
	No Bid
	$2.50 ea.
	$1.50 ea.
	$3.50 ea.

	                                Medium Truck tires
	No Bid
	$5.00 ea.
	$4.00 ea.
	$10.00 ea.

	                                Heavy truck tires
	No Bid
	$10.00 ea.
	$4.00 ea.
	$10.00 ea.

	Heavy machinery, scraper, etc. tires
	No Bid
	$25.00  ea.
	$25.00 ea.
	$30.00 ea.


***Not licensed to transport scrap tires
